UTILITIES COMMISSION

CITY OF NEW SMYRNA BEACH, FLORIDA

BID NO.  01-08A
Bid Tab
	BIDDER
	TOTAL LUMP SUM
	PER CUT RATE:

207 WILLIAMSON


	PER CUT RATE:

SMITH STREET
	PER CUT RATE:

SOUTH BEACH
	PER CUT RATE: 
3RD AVENUE
	PER CUT RATE: 
(6) WELLS SAMSULA
	PER CUT RATE:

 (6) WELLS SR#44


	PER CUT RATE: STORAGE POND
	PER CUT RATE: 
2640 PAIGE
	PER CUT RATE: 
LIFT STATION 60
	PER CUT RATE:
LIFT STATION 03
	PER CUT RATE: 
DECHLOR. SITE

	Bon Terre Group        386-852-4335
	*22,704.00
	Per Cut:

270.00
	Per Cut:

60.00
 
	Per Cut:

30.00

	Per Cut:

30.00
	Per Cut:

162.00
	Per Cut:

80.00
	Per Cut:

*300.00
	Per Cut:

150.00
	Per Cut:

30.00
	Per Cut:

15.00
	Per Cut:

30.00

	
	
	W/Weed&Trim:

405.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

80.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

45.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

45.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

180.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

90.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

*600.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

220.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

45.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

30.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

45.00


	CCR Total Turf           386-804-1944
	NO BID
	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:



	
	
	W/Weed&Trim:

        
	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim;


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:



	Cory Lawn Svc.           386-427-6862
	26,472.00
	Per Cut:

300.00
	Per Cut:

100.00
	Per Cut:

30.00
	Per Cut:

30.00
	Per Cut:

200.00

	Per Cut:

90.00
	Per Cut:

300.00
	Per Cut:

260.00
	Per Cut:

30.00
	Per Cut:

20.00
	Per Cut:

25.00

	
	
	W/Weed&Trim:

450.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

130.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

45.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

35.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

250.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

125.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

N/A
	W/Weed&Trim:

335.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

40.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

25.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

35.00


	Dora Landscaping 

407-947-8278
	NO BID
	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:



	
	
	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:




Recommend Award To: _________________________ 
Basis of Award: Meeting Specifications of Bid #01-08A
Signature:_________________________________________________________________ 
Director of Water and Wastewater                                 
UTILITIES COMMISSION

CITY OF NEW SMYRNA BEACH, FLORIDA

BID NO.  01-08A

Bid Tab

	BIDDER
	TOTAL LUMP SUM
	PER CUT RATE:

207 WILLIAMSON


	PER CUT RATE:

SMITH STREET
	PER CUT RATE:

SOUTH BEACH
	PER CUT RATE: 

3RD AVENUE
	PER CUT RATE: 

(6) WELLS SAMSULA
	PER CUT RATE:

 (6) WELLS SR#44


	PER CUT RATE: STORAGE POND
	PER CUT RATE: 

2640 PAIGE
	PER CUT RATE: 

LIFT STATION 60
	PER CUT RATE:

LIFT STATION 03
	PER CUT RATE: 

DECHLOR. SITE

	Glencoe Lawns
386-427-0239
	24,370.00
	Per Cut:

295.00
	Per Cut:

90.00
 
	Per Cut:

30.00

	Per Cut:

30.00
	Per Cut:

175.00
	Per Cut:

70.00
	Per Cut:

250.00
	Per Cut:

245.00
	Per Cut:

40.00
	Per Cut:

20.00
	Per Cut:

45.00

	
	
	W/Weed&Trim:

425.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

120.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

45.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

35.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

195.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

90.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

N/A
	W/Weed&Trim:

295.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

45.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

20.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

50.00

	Luke Bros.
727-937-6458
	NO BID
	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:



	
	
	W/Weed&Trim:

        
	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim;


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:



	Professional Property Maint.
386-676-2515
	NO BID

	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:



	
	
	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:



	Quick Cut
386-788-2314
	NO BID
	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:



	
	
	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:




Recommend Award To: _________________________ 
Basis of Award: Meeting Specifications of Bid #01-08A

Signature:_________________________________________________________________ 

Director of Water and Wastewater                                 
UTILITIES COMMISSION

CITY OF NEW SMYRNA BEACH, FLORIDA

BID NO.  01-08A

Bid Tab

	BIDDER
	TOTAL LUMP SUM
	PER CUT RATE:

207 WILLIAMSON


	PER CUT RATE:

SMITH STREET
	PER CUT RATE:

SOUTH BEACH
	PER CUT RATE: 

3RD AVENUE
	PER CUT RATE: 

(6) WELLS SAMSULA
	PER CUT RATE:

 (6) WELLS SR#44


	PER CUT RATE: STORAGE POND
	PER CUT RATE: 

2640 PAIGE
	PER CUT RATE: 

LIFT STATION 60
	PER CUT RATE:

LIFT STATION 03
	PER CUT RATE: 

DECHLOR. SITE

	RLI
386-314-9575
	NO BID
	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:

 
	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:



	
	
	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:



	Mike’s Lawn
386-299-9818
	NO BID
	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:



	
	
	W/Weed&Trim:

        
	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim;


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:



	Sunworks
386-738-9642
	NO BID

	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:



	
	
	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:



	Servello & Son
407-754-6723
	22,782.00
	Per Cut:

290.00
	Per Cut:

80.00
	Per Cut:

28.00

	Per Cut:

28.00
	Per Cut:

60.00
	Per Cut:

170.00
	Per Cut:

375.00
	Per Cut:

130.00
	Per Cut:

45.00
	Per Cut:

45.00
	Per Cut:

50.00

	
	
	W/Weed&Trim:

440.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

115.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

43.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

43.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

80.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

190.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

N/A
	W/Weed&Trim:

160.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

55.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

55.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

55.00


Recommend Award To: _________________________ 
Basis of Award: Meeting Specifications of Bid #01-08A

Signature:_________________________________________________________________ 

Director of Water and Wastewater                                 
UTILITIES COMMISSION

CITY OF NEW SMYRNA BEACH, FLORIDA

BID NO.  01-08A

Bid Tab

	BIDDER
	TOTAL LUMP SUM
	PER CUT RATE:

207 WILLIAMSON


	PER CUT RATE:

SMITH STREET
	PER CUT RATE:

SOUTH BEACH
	PER CUT RATE: 

3RD AVENUE
	PER CUT RATE: 

(6) WELLS SAMSULA
	PER CUT RATE:

 (6) WELLS SR#44


	PER CUT RATE: STORAGE POND
	PER CUT RATE: 

2640 PAIGE
	PER CUT RATE: 

LIFT STATION 60
	PER CUT RATE:

LIFT STATION 03
	PER CUT RATE: 

DECHLOR. SITE

	Southland Specialty Grp
904-814-1906
	24,992.00
	Per Cut:

270.00
	Per Cut:

85.00
 
	Per Cut:

30.00

	Per Cut:

27.00
	Per Cut:

160.00
	Per Cut:

60.00
	Per Cut:

362.00
	Per Cut:

270.00
	Per Cut:

30.00
	Per Cut:

30.00
	Per Cut:

23.00

	
	
	W/Weed&Trim:

430.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

115.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

35.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

30.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

185.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

80.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

N/A
	W/Weed&Trim:

340.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

35.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

35.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

27.00

	Tuff Turf
386-760-4130
	NO BID
	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:


	Per Cut:



	
	
	W/Weed&Trim:

        
	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim;


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:


	W/Weed&Trim:



	United Lawn Svc.
386-409-3671
	29,990.00

	Per Cut:

250.00
	Per Cut:

60.00
	Per Cut:

40.00
	Per Cut:

30.00
	Per Cut:

150.00

	Per Cut:

200.00
	Per Cut:

305.00
	Per Cut:

300.00
	Per Cut:

30.00
	Per Cut:

20.00
	Per Cut:

20.00

	
	
	W/Weed&Trim:

425.00

	W/Weed&Trim:

135.00

	W/Weed&Trim:

50.00

	W/Weed&Trim:

40.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

180.00

	W/Weed&Trim:

250.00

	W/Weed&Trim:

N/A

	W/Weed&Trim:

450.00

	W/Weed&Trim:

50.00

	W/Weed&Trim:

25.00

	W/Weed&Trim:

30.00


	Ziegler
386-960-5364
	*20,865.00
	Per Cut:

300.00

	Per Cut:

105.00

	Per Cut:

30.00

	Per Cut:

30.00

	Per Cut:

60.00

	Per Cut:

180.00

	Per Cut:

350.00

	Per Cut:

150.00

	Per Cut:

30.00

	Per Cut:

30.00

	Per Cut:

30.00


	
	
	W/Weed&Trim:

450.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

125.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

35.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

35.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

70.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

200.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

*525.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

200.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

35.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

35.00
	W/Weed&Trim:

35.00


Recommend Award To: _________________________ 
Basis of Award: Meeting Specifications of Bid #01-08A

Signature:_________________________________________________________________ 

Director of Water and Wastewater                                 
PAGE  
                                                                            
4

